Page | of 3

Diane Gorrow

From: "Harry Brackett" <lelan4444@aol.com>
To: "Gorrow Diane" <gorrow@soulefirm.com>
Sent: Saturday, August 20, 2011 4:11 PM

Subject:  Fwd: Attorney-Client Privilege Information - Conference Call Billing

From: hfb4444 <hfb4444@comcast.net>

To: lelan4444 <lelan4444@aol.com>

Sent: Fri, Aug 19, 2011 4:45 pm

Subject: Fwd: Attorney-Client Privilege Information - Conference Call
Billing

From: "Megan Turnbull" &It;mmshea@chicagogsb.edu&gt;

To: "skip hanson" &lt;skip hanson@newenglandssc.org&gt;, "Arthur
Hanson" &lt;ahanson004@gmail.com&gt;

Cc: "Henry Brackett" &lt;hfb4444@comcast.net&gt;,
kmemmesheimer@hpglaw.com

Sent: Friday, May 27, 2011 11:04:51 AM

Subject: Attorney-Client Privilege Information - Conference Call Billing

Skip,

I have approval from Henry to move forward with the hourly rate for
now. However, we ask that Rhoades' firm needs follow the outlined
instructions for billing.

Send the bill in "care of " our law firm. The Invoice can be directed
to ORCSD (Oyster River Cooperative School District) but sent to:

Kimberly J.H. Memmesheimer, Esquire
Hoefle, Phoenix, Gormley & Roberts, P.A.
402 State Street - P.O. Box 4480
Portsmouth, NH 03802-4480

Thank you for facilitating this on our behalf. I hope we can chat to
follow up afterwards. Perhaps late Sunday morning/early afternoon? Let
me know what may work well for you.
Best Regards,

-Megan
On May 27, 2011, at 9:44 AM, skip hanson wrote:

&gt; Your thoughts. Thanks. Skip

&gt; Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

&egt;

&gt; From: Rhoades Alderson &lt;ralderson@nharbor.com&gt;
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&gt; Date: Fri, 27 May 2011 09:34:32 -0400

&gt; To: Skip Hanson&lt;skip_hanson@newenglandssc.org&gt;
&gt; Subject: RE: Conference call '

&gt;

&gt; Hi Skip,

&et;

&gt; I can be available for the conference call. The only thing I
should probably say up front is that my firm will need me to bill at
the non-profit rate of $125/hour for my time on this project. If we
decide to work together further, we can put together a contract for
future work, but for now the firm will need to bill hourly. Just want
to make sure they’re ok with that as we move ahead. Thanks, Skip.
&gt;

&gt; Best,

&gt; Rhoades

&gt;

&gt;

&gt;

&gt;

&gt; Rhoades Alderson

&gt; New Harbor Group

&gt; One Davol Square, Suite 300

&gt; Providence RI, 02903

&gt; 401.831.1200

&gt; 401.477.4020 (c)

&gt; .

&gt; From: Skip Hanson [mailto:skip_hanson@newenglandssc.org]
&gt; Sent: Thursday, May 26, 2011 7:05 PM

&gt; To: Rhoades Alderson

&gt; Subject: Conference call

&gt; '

&gt; Hi Rhoades - Three board members from the Oyster River School
District (Durham NH) would like to conference call with you on Friday
at 2:30 PM. Neither Duke or I are available and I told them that I
would talk with them this weekend. '
&gt;

&gt; Attached is a draft release that they would like to have you
review prior to the call. We can use the following conference number
(they all have): 18883948197 - your moderator number is

&gt;

&gt; If this is time is not possible, could you let me know as soon as
possible? Thanks - Skip

&gt;

&gt; -

&gt;

&gt; Skip Hanson

&gt; New Hampshire Liaison

&gt; New England Secondary School Consortium

&gt

&gt; skip_hanson@nessc.org

&gt; Cell- <
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