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Diane Gorrow

From: "Kim Memmesheimer' <KMemmesheimer@hpgrlaw.com>

To: "Gorrow Diane" <gorrow@soulefirm.com>; <llevesque@orcsd.org>
Cc: <hfb4444@comcast.net>

Sent: Friday, August 19, 2011 10:10 AM

Subject: FW: meeting today with PR people
Here is the first in the string of the e-mails regarding the May 23" meeting at my office.

Kim Memmesheimer

From: Ann Wright [mailto:ann_wright@comcast.net]
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2011 9:15 AM

To: Kim Memmesheimer; Henry Brackett

Subject: meeting today with PR people

Henry and Kim,

| am unable to make the meeting today due to prior obligations at that time. Also, In discussing
this meeting with my husband, who is a corporate general counsel, he expressed concern that
this meeting may be breaking the right-to-know law. He said that with a third-party present
there is no privilege of confidentiality.

| would appreciate someone letting me know what occurs at this meeting (could a board
member take minutes, perhaps?).

Thanks so much, and fingers crossed for sun (or at least a respite from rain!)

Ann

8/19/2011



Hoefle, Phoenix, Gormley & Roberts, P.A.

402 State Street
P.O. Box 4480

Portsmouth, NH 03802-4480

Ph:603-436-0666 Fax:603-431-0879

2 Wheelwright Drive

Attention:

DISBURSEMENTS:

Jus-30-11 Communications Consulting
Tatals
Total Rees & Disbursendetits

Previous Balance
Previous Payments

Balance Due Now

Plogse wote file rimb

Emiployer Idenitification No. 02:0435498

File #:
Inv #

Dishursements

875.00

June 30, 2011

10157
34537

Receipts

$0.00

$875.00

$6.934.20

$7,809:20

ibier-or invoice number when making a.payment to tusure proper credit



New Harbor Group i
1 Davol Square , InVOlCe

Suite 300

Providence, RI 02903 06/30/2011

(401)831-1200
jrazzino@nharbor.com

07/30/2011

Kimberly J.H. Memmesheimer, Esquire
Hoefle, Phoenix, Gormley & Roberts, P.A.

402 State Street - P.O. Box 4480
Portsmouth, NH 03802

$875.00

Please detach top portion and return with your payment.

S

« Services Rendered, (7 hrs @ $125/hr) 875.00




