Attorneys at Law

220 Main Street Salem, New Hampshire 03079 Tax I.D. 02-0273498

603-898-9776 FAX 603-898-3418

OYSTER RIVER SCHOOL DISTRICT Superintendent's Office SAU #5 36 Coe Drive Durham, NH 03824 September 07, 2011

-Invoice No. 48857

| RE: Legal services and expenses | |
|---|--------------|
| | Amount |
| Previous balance | \$3,592.25 |
| 08/25/2011 Payment - thank you | (\$3,592.25) |
| Total payments and adjustments | (\$3,592.25) |
| Services rendered | |
| | Hours |
| 08/01/2011 DMG Petition: Reviewed Superintendent Levesque's e-mail and website. | 0.40 |
| | 1.40 |
| 09/02/2011 GPG Conference with Diene Comerce recording Possel issues | 0.40 |
| 08/02/2011 GBG Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding Board issues. | 0.40 |
| | 0.40 |
| DMG Petition: Conference with Interim Superintendent Levesque; drafted statement; reviewed petitions; conference with Attorney Gordon Graham. | 1.30 |
| | 0.20 |
| 08/03/2011 | 0.90 |
| 08/04/2011 | 0.10 |

Attorneys at Law

| OYSTER RIVER | 220 Main Street Tax I.D. 02-0273498 SCHOOL DISTRIC Falem, New Hampshire 03079 | Page 2 |
|---------------|---|--------|
| | 603-898-9776 FAX 603-898-3418 | Hours |
| 08/04/2011 | | 0.80 |
| DM | G Right-To-Know Law: Conference with Wendy DiFruscio; reviewed petition. | 0.20 |
| 08/08/2011 DM | Right-To-Know Law: Outlined David Taylor's claims; called Wendy DiFruscio; reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's message. | 0.50 |
| 08/09/2011 DM | G Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed David Taylor's e-mails; called Superintendent Levesque; e-mail to David Taylor. | 0.20 |
| 08/10/2011 | | 0.30 |
| DM | G Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed David Taylor's e-mail; conference with Superintendent Levesque; e-mail to David Taylor; reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail; began reviewing e-mails. | 2.00 |
| 08/11/2011 DM | G Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed e-mails; redacted e-mails; reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail; conference with David Taylor and Superintendent Levesque; reviewed David Taylor's e-mail; letter to David Taylor. | 3.70 |
| DM | G Petition: Reviewed Superintendent Levesque's e-mail. | 0.10 |
| 08/12/2011 DN | G Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed e-mails; letter to JoAnn Portalupi, Jennifer Rief and David Taylor; reviewed order of notice; letter to Superintendent Levesque. | 1.30 |
| 08/15/2011 DM | G Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed David Taylor's e-mail; reviewed first set of responses; letter to Superintendent Levesque. | 3.20 |
| GB | G Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding Right-to-Know requests. | 0.20 |
| 08/16/2011 DN | G Right-To-Know Law: Conference with Henry Brackett and Superintendent Levesque; reviewed documents produced and not produced; e-mails to and from David Taylor; research; reviewed minutes. | 2.50 |
| GE | G Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding Right-to-Know case. | 0.20 |
| 08/17/2011 DM | IG Right-To-Know Law: Conference with Superintendent Levesque; reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's fax and documents; letter to David Taylor; reviewed David Taylor's e-mails; reviewed and responded to | 1.60 |

Attorneys at Law

| OYSTER RIVER SO | 220 Main Street Tax I.D. 02-0273498 CHOOL DISTRIC Galem, New Hampshire 03079 | Page 3 |
|-----------------|--|--------|
| | 603-898-9776 FAX 603-898-3418 | Hours |
| s, | Superintendent Levesque's e-mail; e-mail to Superintendent Levesque and Henry Brackett; prepared for meeting. | |
| 08/17/2011 GBG | Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding of Right-to-Know Law. | 0.20 |
| 08/18/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Attended meeting with Henry Brackett, Superintendent Levesque and Attorney Kim Memmesheimer. | 4.00 |
| DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Returned Henry Brackett's call; reviewed David Taylor's e-mail; e-mail to David Taylor and Superintendent Levesque. | 2.10 |
| 08/19/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed Attorney Memmesheimer's e-mails; redacted e-mails; e-mails to Attorney Memmesheimer; reviewed school board minutes; e-mail to Henry Brackett; conference with Henry Brackett; reviewed and responded to Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail; letter to David Taylor; began drafting answer. | 2.80 |
| 08/20/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed e-mails. | 1.00 |
| 08/21/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Redacted e-mails; reviewed David Taylor's e-mail; conferences with David Taylor and Henry Brackett. | 2.10 |
| DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Conference with Henry Brackett; reviewed and redacted e-mails. | 0.80 |
| 08/22/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Meeting with Henry Brackett; attended Henry Brackett's deposition. | 10.50 |
| 08/23/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Reviewed e-mail from court reporter; conference with David Taylor. | 0.50 |
| DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Conference with Henry Brackett. | 0.60 |
| 08/24/2011 DMG | Right-To-Know Law: Conference with Superintendent Levesque and Henry Brackett; conferences with Attorney Dennis Ducharme and Henry Brackett; conference with David Taylor; e-mail to Superintendent Levesque and Henry Brackett. | 1.50 |
| GBG | Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding defense of right-to-know lawsuit. | 0.30 |

Attorneys at Law

| | Adom | eys at Law | | | |
|--------------|--|--|------------------------|---------|------------|
| OYSTER RIV | 220 N ER SCHOOL DISTRIC Galem, New H | lain Street lampshire 03079 | Tax I.D. 02-0273498 | Page | 4 |
| | 603- | 898-9776 03-898-3418 | - | Ho | <u>irs</u> |
| 08/26/2011 I | DMG Right-To-Know Law: Confer Henry Brackett; conferences we Henry Brackett; reviewed file and from David Taylor. | with Attorney De | nnis Ducharine and | 1. | .10 |
| I | OMG | | | 0 | .20 |
| 08/29/2011 | OMG T | | | 0 | .20 |
| 08/30/2011 | DMG | | | 1 | .80 |
| 08/31/2011 | DMC | | | 0 |).60 |
| | 2220-53320-01= | 44 22 3 _/ 5 | | Am | ount |
| | Total services rendered Additional charges: | | 52.20 | \$10,44 | |
| 08/10/2011 | \$Photocopies Right-To-Know Law: Print 506 onleattachments. | ine e-mails with | corresponding | \$1 | 19.50 |
| | \$Photocopies Photocopies: Photocopy e-mails for | Right-To-Know | Law responses. | \$1 | 12.50 |
| 08/15/2011 | \$Postage Right-To-Know Law suit: Postage. | | | ; | \$5.36 |
| | \$Photocopies Right-To-Know Law suit: Photoco | pies. | | | \$5.00 |
| | Total costs | Oyster Elver Cooperate SAU | ve School District # 5 | \$ | 42.36 |
| | Total amount of this bill | OW ON Accell | Commissed | \$10,4 | 82.36 |
| | Balance due | Circle Oas Partial (FO Only) Puil Signature | Jense - | \$10,4 | 182.36 |

Please include Invoice No. when making payment. Thank you.

LIMIT CHANCEL O CHIMIL

DMG Personnel/Right-to-Know Law: Conference with Superintendent Levesque: file memo.

0.40

12/05/2011 DMG Right-to-Know Law: Reviewed and responded to Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail.

0.50

| 12/16/2011 DM | Right-to-Know Law: Reviewed and responded to Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail. | 0.20 |
|----------------|--|------|
| 12/18/2011 | | 0.10 |
| 12/20/2011 DMC | Right-to-Know Law: Reviewed Superintendent Levesque's e-mail; conference with Superintendent Levesque; file memo. | 0.40 |
| 12/21/2011 | | 0.20 |
| 4 | | 0.10 |
| 12/22/2011 MSE | Reviewed email from Terri Donovan regarding ORPaSS negotiations. | 0.10 |
| 12/27/2011 DMC | Right-to-Know Law: Reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail and statute; called and e-mailed Wendy DiFruscio; conference with Superintendent Levesque; file memo. | 0.30 |
| | | |

| 01/ 05/2012 DMG | Right-to-Know Law: Conference with Wendy DiFruscio; reviewed and responded to Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail; file memo. | 0.60 |
|------------------------|--|------|
| | | 0.90 |
| 01/06/2012 DMG | Right-to-Know Law: Reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail, statute and Littleton order; letter to Wendy DiFruscio. | 0.70 |

Attorneys at Law

| 220 Main Street Tax I.D. 02-0273498 OYSTER RIVER SCHOOL DISTRICT Salem, New Hampshire 03079 | Page 2 |
|---|--------|
| 603-898-9776 FAX 603-898-3418 | Hours |
| 01/09/2012 | 0.10 |
| DMG Right-to-Know Law: Reviewed Superintendent Levesque's e-mail and statute; conferences with Attorney Gordon Graham and Superintendent Levesque; file memo. | 0.80 |
| 01/10/2012 DMG | 0.70 |
| MSE | 0.40 |
| GBG Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding Right-to-Know selection of administrator; review process. | 0.30 |
| 01/13/2012 DMG | 0.40 |
| 01/17/2012 DMG Various issues: Conferences with Superintendent Levesque and Attorney Gordon Graham; research; conference with Board member. | 1.50 |
| GBG Conference with Diane Gorrow regarding superintendent selection process. | 0.20 |
| 01/18/2012 DMG | 0.80 |
| | 0.20 |
| 01/19/2012 DMG | 0.20 |
| 01/23/2012 DMG | 0.50 |
| 01/25/2012 DMG | |
| 01/26/2012 DMG Right-to-Know Law: Conferences with Superintendent Levesque and Wendy DiFruscio; reviewed Wendy DiFruscio's e-mail and cases; file memo. | 0.80 |
| 01/30/2012 DMG | 0.10 |